
Revised 1/5/2021

BEFORE THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF LANE COUNTY, OREGON 

ORDER NO: 23-05-02-03 IN THE MATTER OF APPROVING 
ANNUAL PUBLIC WORKS PURCHASE 
CONTRACTS FOR ROAD 
MAINTENANCE MATERIALS, AND 
DELEGATING AUTHORITY TO THE 
COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR TO 
EXECUTE THE CONTRACTS 

WHEREAS, Lane Manual Chapter 20 sets forth the County’s policies regarding award, 
acceptance, and amendment of grants and contracts; and 

WHEREAS, all of the contracts listed below have been bid in accordance with the 
requirements of the Lane Manual, including the requirements for competitive selection; and 

WHEREAS, all of the materials to be purchased under the contracts listed below are routine 
to the implementation of current County programs and services or have been previously discussed 
or approved by the Board; and 

WHEREAS, these contracts may exceed the County Administrator’s authority to execute 
granted in Lane Manual sections 20.650 to 20.665, 

NOW, THEREFORE, the Board of County Commissioners of Lane County ORDERS as follows: 

That the contracts with the vendors referenced in Exhibit A – 2023 All Bids Recap 
are approved and the County Administrator is delegated authority to execute the 
approved contracts. 

ADOPTED this 2nd day of May, 2023  

Pat Farr, Chair 

Lane County Board of Commissioners 

LCGADLJ
Pat Farr



Lane County Department of Public Works Bid Recap Date of Opening: 10:00 AM 

Contract: 23/24-51 

Project Name: Rock Materials - FY 23/24 Annual Price Agreement 

Tuesday, April 11, 2023 

- pg 1 of 6 -

Unit Price Amount 

No Bid $0.00 

$16.00 $0.00 

$11.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$17.00 $0.00 

$16.00 $0.00 

$11.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

$14.00 $0.00 

$16.00 $0.00 

$9.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$9.00 $0.00 

$8.00 $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

$10.00 $0.00 

$9.00 $0.00 

$22.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

$12.50 $0.00 

$10.25 $0.00 

$9.20 $0.00 

$12.20 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$32.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$11.90 $0.00 

$9.35 $0.00 

$9.20 $0.00 

$16.35 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

$14.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$13.50 $0.00 

$20.00 $0.00 

$14.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

$8.00 $0.00 

$16.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$16.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$12.00 $0.00 

Item 
No. 

Item Name Unit Qty 

1 1 1/2" Crushed Rock Open TON 0 

2 1 1/2" Round Open TON 0 

3 1 1/2" -0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

4 1/2"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

5 3" Crushed Open TON 0 

6 3" Round Open TON 0 

7 3"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

8 3/4" Crushed Reject TON 0 

9 3/4" Crushed Rock Open TON 0 

10 3/4" Round Open TON 0 

11 3/4"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

12 3/8" Round (Pea Rock) TON 0 

13 5"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

14 5" -3" Crushed (Logger Special) TON 0 

15 5"-7" Crushed Rock Open TON 0 

16 6" Crushed Open TON 0 

17 Gabion Rock - 3" to 12" Open TON 0 

18 6"-0" Crushed-Jaw Open TON 0 

4 WILDISH BLDG MAT. CO, 
DBA WILDISH SAND & 
GRAVEL CO PO BOX 
40310 EUGENE, OR 
97404 

3 RiverBend Materials- Coburg 
Rd Location PO Box 1067 
Eugene, OR 97440 

2 DELTA SAND AND 
GRAVEL 
999 Division Ave. 
Eugene, OR 97404 

1 CONSER QUARRY CO. 
27387 FERGUSON RD 
JUNCTION CITY, OR 
97448 

Prepared By: MST 

Checked By: MST 



Item 
No. 

Item Name Unit Qty 

19 6"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

20 6"-3" Crushed Rock TON 0 

21 Bar Run TON 0 

22 Beach Sand TON 0 

23 Fairway Sand TON 0 

24 Fill Sand TON 0 

25 Landscape Rock TON 0 

26 Loam TON 0 

27 Machine Selected Rip Rap TON 0 

28 Non-Machine Selected Rip Rap TON 0 

29 Portland Cement Concrete - 3500 psi TON 0 

30 Quarry Pit Run TON 0 

Unit Price Amount 

$12.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$45.00 $0.00 

$40.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$13.00 $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$5.50 $0.00 

$29.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$9.90 $0.00 

$32.00 $0.00 

$17.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$12.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$25.00 $0.00 

$7.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$16.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$8.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$20.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

4 WILDISH BLDG MAT. CO, 
DBA WILDISH SAND & 
GRAVEL CO PO BOX 
40310 EUGENE, OR 
97404 

3 RiverBend Materials- Coburg 
Rd Location PO Box 1067 
Eugene, OR 97440 

2 DELTA SAND AND 
GRAVEL 
999 Division Ave. 
Eugene, OR 97404 

1 CONSER QUARRY CO. 
27387 FERGUSON 
ROAD 
JUNCTION CITY, OR 
97448 

Prepared By: 

Checked By: 

MST 
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MST 



Item 
No. 

Item Name Unit Qty 

1 1 1/2" Crushed Rock Open TON 0 

2 1 1/2" Round Open TON 0 

3 1 1/2" -0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

4 1/2"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

5 3" Crushed Open TON 0 

6 3" Round Open TON 0 

7 3"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

8 3/4" Crushed Reject TON 0 

9 3/4" Crushed Rock Open TON 0 

10 3/4" Round Open TON 0 

11 3/4"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

12 3/8" Round (Pea Rock) TON 0 

13 5"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

14 5" -3" Crushed (Logger Special) TON 0 

15 5"-7" Crushed Rock Open TON 0 

16 6" Crushed Open TON 0 

17 Gabion Rock - 3" to 12" Open TON 0 

18 6"-0" Crushed-Jaw Open TON 0 

19 6"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

20 6"-3" Crushed Rock TON 0 

21 Bar Run TON 0 

22 Beach Sand TON 0 

Unit Price Amount 

$20.25 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$15.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$15.25 $0.00 

$9.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$15.25 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$15.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

$40.00 $0.00 

$15.25 $0.00 

$15.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

$20.25 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$15.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$15.25 $0.00 

$9.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$15.25 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$15.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

$40.00 $0.00 

$15.25 $0.00 

$15.25 $0.00 

$20.25 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

$18.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

$18.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$18.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

$25.00 $0.00 

$25.00 $0.00 

$25.00 $0.00 

$13.50 $0.00 

$13.50 $0.00 

$25.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

$18.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

$18.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$18.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

$25.00 $0.00 

$25.00 $0.00 

$25.00 $0.00 

$13.50 $0.00 

$13.50 $0.00 

$25.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

8 RR AGGREGATE LLC 
dba MARTIN CREEK 
PO BOX 826 
DRAIN, OR 97435 

7 RR AGGREGATE LLC 
dba HAWLEY CREEK 
QUARRY 
PO BOX 826 
DRAIN, OR 97435 

6 Aggregate Resource 
Crushing, LLC 
Sears Road Quarry 
4080 Commercial Avenue 
Springfield, OR 97478 

5 Aggregate Resource 
Crushing, LLC 
Bradford Quarry 
4080 Commercial Ave 
Springfield, OR 97478 

Prepared By: 

Checked By: 

MST 

MST 
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Total Amount of Bid: 

Unit Price Amount 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$35.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$35.00 $0.00 

$35.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$35.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$35.00 $0.00 

$35.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$55.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$55.00 $0.00 

$40.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$12.25 $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$55.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$55.00 $0.00 

$40.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$12.25 $0.00 

Item 
No. 

Item Name Unit Qty 

23 Fairway Sand TON 0 

24 Fill Sand TON 0 

25 Landscape Rock TON 0 

26 Loam TON 0 

27 Machine Selected Rip Rap TON 0 

28 Non-Machine Selected Rip Rap TON 0 

29 Portland Cement Concrete - 3500 psi TON 0 

30 Quarry Pit Run TON 0 

8 RR AGGREGATE LLC 
dba MARTIN CREEK 
PO BOX 826 
DRAIN, OR 97435 

7 RR AGGREGATE LLC 
dba HAWLEY CREEK 
QUARRY 
PO BOX 826 
DRAIN, OR 97435 

6 Aggregate Resource 
Crushing, LLC 
Sears Road Quarry 
4080 Commercial Avenue 
Springfield, OR 97478 

5 Aggregate Resource 
Crushing, LLC 
Bradford Quarry 
4080 Commercial Ave 
Springfield, OR 97478 

Prepared By: 

Checked By: 

MST 

MST 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 
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Item 
No. 

Item Name Unit Qty 

1 1 1/2" Crushed Rock Open TON 0 

2 1 1/2" Round Open TON 0 

3 1 1/2" -0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

4 1/2"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

5 3" Crushed Open TON 0 

6 3" Round Open TON 0 

7 3"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

8 3/4" Crushed Reject TON 0 

9 3/4" Crushed Rock Open TON 0 

10 3/4" Round Open TON 0 

11 3/4"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

12 3/8" Round (Pea Rock) TON 0 

13 5"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

14 5" -3" Crushed (Logger Special) TON 0 

15 5"-7" Crushed Rock Open TON 0 

16 6" Crushed Open TON 0 

17 Gabion Rock - 3" to 12" Open TON 0 

18 6"-0" Crushed-Jaw Open TON 0 

19 6"-0" Crushed Rock TON 0 

20 6"-3" Crushed Rock TON 0 

21 Bar Run TON 0 

22 Beach Sand TON 0 

Unit Price Amount 

$20.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$17.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$20.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$17.50 $0.00 

$12.50 $0.00 

$20.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$17.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$20.00 $0.00 

$20.00 $0.00 

$65.00 $0.00 

$17.50 $0.00 

$17.50 $0.00 

$20.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

$19.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$18.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$19.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$18.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$19.00 $0.00 

$19.00 $0.00 

$19.00 $0.00 

$50.00 $0.00 

$16.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$19.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

$16.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$13.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.50 $0.00 

$14.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$11.50 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

$19.15 $0.00 

$25.55 $0.00 

$13.30 $0.00 

$11.35 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$12.95 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$24.95 $0.00 

$22.95 $0.00 

$13.30 $0.00 

$22.95 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$19.15 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

12 KNIFE RIVER 
CORPORATION - 
NORTHWEST 
32260 OLD HWY 34 
TANGENT, OR 97389 

11 FISHER LAND 
COMPANY DBA 
OAKRIDGE SAND & 
GRAVEL 
2295 COBURG ROAD, 
SUITE 105 
EUGENE, OR 97401 

10 FISHER LAND 
COMPANY  
DBA HALE VALLEY 
ROCK PRODUCTS 
2295 COBURG RD 
SUITE 105 
EUGENE, OR 97401 

9 COBURG ROAD 
QUARRY 
90436 Coburg Rd. 
Eugene, OR 97408 

Prepared By: 

Checked By: 

MST 

MST 
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Total Amount of Bid:

Unit Price Amount 

$24.25 $0.00 

$21.65 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$26.15 $0.00 

$120.00 $0.00 

$59.75 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$12.35 $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

No Bid $0.00 

$14.50 $0.00 

$50.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$50.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$60.00 $0.00 

$50.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

No Bid $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$65.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$65.00 $0.00 

$65.00 $0.00 

No Bid $0.00 

$15.50 $0.00 

Item 
No. 

Item Name Unit Qty 

23 Fairway Sand TON 0 

24 Fill Sand TON 0 

25 Landscape Rock TON 0 

26 Loam TON 0 

27 Machine Selected Rip Rap TON 0 

28 Non-Machine Selected Rip Rap TON 0 

29 Portland Cement Concrete - 3500 psi TON 0 

30 Quarry Pit Run TON 0 

12 KNIFE RIVER 
CORPORATION - 
NORTHWEST 
32260 OLD HWY 34 
TANGENT, OR 97389 

11 FISHER LAND 
COMPANY DBA 
OAKRIDGE SAND & 
GRAVEL 
2295 COBURG ROAD, 
SUITE 105 
EUGENE, OR 97401 

10 FISHER LAND 
COMPANY  
DBA HALE VALLEY 
ROCK PRODUCTS 
2295 COBURG RD 
SUITE 105 
EUGENE, OR 97401 

9 COBURG ROAD 
QUARRY 
90436 Coburg Rd. 
Eugene, OR 97408 

Prepared By: 

Checked By: 

MST 

MST 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 
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Lane County Department of Public Works Bid Recap Date of Opening: 10:00 AM 

Contract: 23/24-53 

Project Name: Asphaltic Mix Patching Materials - FY23/24 Annual Price Agreement 

Total Amount of Bid: 

Tuesday, April 11, 2023 

Page 1 of 1 

Engineer's Estimate: 

Unit Price Amount 

No Bid $0.00 

$81.00 $0.00

No Bid $0.00 

$950.00 $0.00

Unit Price Amount 

$57.94 $0.00

$57.94 $0.00

$69.94 $0.00

$800.00 $0.00 

Unit Price Amount 

       $52.75 $0.00 

       $53.25 $0.00 

       $59.00 $0.00 

$725.00 $0.00

Item 
No. 

Item Name Unit Qty 

1 LEVEL 2, 3/4" INCH ACP TON 0 

2 LEVEL 2, 1/2" INCH ACP TON 0 

3 LEVEL 2, 3/8" INCH ACP TON 0 

4 EMULSIFIED ASPHALT FOR TACK TON 0 

3  Knife River Corporation 
Northwest 

32260 Old Hwy 34 

Tangent, OR 97389 

2  Wildish Construction Co 

3600 Wildish Lane 

Eugene, OR 97408 

1  Riverbend Materials 

PO Box 1067 

Eugene, OR 97440 

Prepared By: 

Checked By: 

MST 

$0.00 $0.00 

* Indicates a discrepancy between contractor's submitted totals and totals calculated from unit costs submitted. $0.00 

$0.00 

MST 




